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WEI’S
TEXTILE
The company offers a wide range of fabrics, including cotton, silk, linen, wool, 

and synthetic blends, in a variety of colors, prints, and functions. Wei's Textile 

works closely with its clients to develop custom fabrics to meet their specific 

needs and requirements. Its state-of-the-art production facilities utilize the latest 

technology and machinery to produce high-quality fabrics efficiently and 

cost-effectively.

We really care about your success &

Let’s begin our collaboration from here…
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WEI’S TEXTILE

The manufacturing process of wool fabric involves several 
stages, each requiring skill and attention to detail. It begins 
with the shearing of wool from the fleece of sheep, which is 
then sorted and graded based on quality and fiber length. The 
raw wool is then washed and scoured to remove impurities 
and excess oil, and spun into yarn using specialized 
machinery. 

Once the yarn is spun, it undergoes a process called weaving, 
in which the threads are interlaced at right angles to create a 
tightly woven fabric. The fabric is then subjected to a process 
called fulling, in which it is washed and agitated to create a 
more dense, compact texture. This process also helps to 
remove any remaining impurities and improve the fabric's 
durability. 

After fulling, the fabric is typically dyed and finished, which 
involves a range of treatments to achieve the desired color, 
texture, and appearance. These treatments may include 
steaming, pressing, and brushing to smooth the surface and 
enhance the fabric's luster. 

Throughout the manufacturing process, skilled artisans work 
tirelessly to ensure that every piece of wool fabric meets the 
highest standards of quality and craftsmanship. From the 
careful selection of raw materials to the meticulous finishing 
touches, every step is a testament to the skill and dedication 
of those who create this timeless and elegant material.

MR001 

COMPOSITION 100% MERINO 
WOOL

FINISHED WIDTH 62/63”

FUNCTION Thermal Regulation 

Anti-Odor

Anti-Bacterial

Wicking

Wool, a textile of timeless elegance, exudes a certain 
sophistication and refinement that is unmatched by other 
materials. The soft, pliable fibers of this luxurious fabric 
create a texture that is both gentle and strong, yielding to the 
touch yet resilient to the elements. Each thread is a testament 
to the meticulous craftsmanship that goes into the creation of 
every piece, with its natural insulating properties providing 
unparalleled warmth and comfort. Whether draped in a 
classic coat or woven into a cozy blanket, wool evokes a sense 
of enduring style and enduring quality that will always 
remain in fashion.
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WEI’S TEXTILE

The manufacturing process of wool fabric involves several 
stages, each requiring skill and attention to detail. It begins 
with the shearing of wool from the fleece of sheep, which is 
then sorted and graded based on quality and fiber length. The 
raw wool is then washed and scoured to remove impurities 
and excess oil, and spun into yarn using specialized 
machinery. 

Once the yarn is spun, it undergoes a process called weaving, 
in which the threads are interlaced at right angles to create a 
tightly woven fabric. The fabric is then subjected to a process 
called fulling, in which it is washed and agitated to create a 
more dense, compact texture. This process also helps to 
remove any remaining impurities and improve the fabric's 
durability. 

After fulling, the fabric is typically dyed and finished, which 
involves a range of treatments to achieve the desired color, 
texture, and appearance. These treatments may include 
steaming, pressing, and brushing to smooth the surface and 
enhance the fabric's luster. 

Throughout the manufacturing process, skilled artisans work 
tirelessly to ensure that every piece of wool fabric meets the 
highest standards of quality and craftsmanship. From the 
careful selection of raw materials to the meticulous finishing 
touches, every step is a testament to the skill and dedication 
of those who create this timeless and elegant material. LF0387 

COMPOSITION 36%Modal+35%Acrylic+15%Wool 
Protein+6%Wool+8%Spandex

FINISHED 
WIDTH

67/68”

FUNCTION Thermal Regulation 

Anti-Odor

Anti-Bacterial

Wicking

Wool, a textile of timeless elegance, exudes a certain 
sophistication and refinement that is unmatched by other 
materials. The soft, pliable fibers of this luxurious fabric 
create a texture that is both gentle and strong, yielding to the 
touch yet resilient to the elements. Each thread is a testament 
to the meticulous craftsmanship that goes into the creation of 
every piece, with its natural insulating properties providing 
unparalleled warmth and comfort. Whether draped in a 
classic coat or woven into a cozy blanket, wool evokes a sense 
of enduring style and enduring quality that will always 
remain in fashion.
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WEI’S TEXTILE

The manufacturing process of wool fabric involves several 
stages, each requiring skill and attention to detail. It begins 
with the shearing of wool from the fleece of sheep, which is 
then sorted and graded based on quality and fiber length. The 
raw wool is then washed and scoured to remove impurities 
and excess oil, and spun into yarn using specialized 
machinery. 

Once the yarn is spun, it undergoes a process called weaving, 
in which the threads are interlaced at right angles to create a 
tightly woven fabric. The fabric is then subjected to a process 
called fulling, in which it is washed and agitated to create a 
more dense, compact texture. This process also helps to 
remove any remaining impurities and improve the fabric's 
durability. 

After fulling, the fabric is typically dyed and finished, which 
involves a range of treatments to achieve the desired color, 
texture, and appearance. These treatments may include 
steaming, pressing, and brushing to smooth the surface and 
enhance the fabric's luster. 

Throughout the manufacturing process, skilled artisans work 
tirelessly to ensure that every piece of wool fabric meets the 
highest standards of quality and craftsmanship. From the 
careful selection of raw materials to the meticulous finishing 
touches, every step is a testament to the skill and dedication 
of those who create this timeless and elegant material. LF0388 

COMPOSITION 36%Modal+35%Acrylic+15%Wool 
Protein+6%Wool+8%Spandex

FINISHED 
WIDTH

67/68”

FUNCTION Thermal Regulation 

Anti-Odor

Anti-Bacterial

Wicking

Wool, a textile of timeless elegance, exudes a certain 
sophistication and refinement that is unmatched by other 
materials. The soft, pliable fibers of this luxurious fabric 
create a texture that is both gentle and strong, yielding to the 
touch yet resilient to the elements. Each thread is a testament 
to the meticulous craftsmanship that goes into the creation of 
every piece, with its natural insulating properties providing 
unparalleled warmth and comfort. Whether draped in a 
classic coat or woven into a cozy blanket, wool evokes a sense 
of enduring style and enduring quality that will always 
remain in fashion.
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WEI’S TEXTILE

The manufacturing process of wool fabric involves several 
stages, each requiring skill and attention to detail. It begins 
with the shearing of wool from the fleece of sheep, which is 
then sorted and graded based on quality and fiber length. The 
raw wool is then washed and scoured to remove impurities 
and excess oil, and spun into yarn using specialized 
machinery. 

Once the yarn is spun, it undergoes a process called weaving, 
in which the threads are interlaced at right angles to create a 
tightly woven fabric. The fabric is then subjected to a process 
called fulling, in which it is washed and agitated to create a 
more dense, compact texture. This process also helps to 
remove any remaining impurities and improve the fabric's 
durability. 

After fulling, the fabric is typically dyed and finished, which 
involves a range of treatments to achieve the desired color, 
texture, and appearance. These treatments may include 
steaming, pressing, and brushing to smooth the surface and 
enhance the fabric's luster. 

Throughout the manufacturing process, skilled artisans work 
tirelessly to ensure that every piece of wool fabric meets the 
highest standards of quality and craftsmanship. From the 
careful selection of raw materials to the meticulous finishing 
touches, every step is a testament to the skill and dedication 
of those who create this timeless and elegant material. LF0389 

COMPOSITION 36%Modal+35%Acrylic+15%Wool 
Protein+6%Wool+8%Spandex

FINISHED 
WIDTH

67/68”

FUNCTION Thermal Regulation 

Anti-Odor

Anti-Bacterial

Wicking

Wool, a textile of timeless elegance, exudes a certain 
sophistication and refinement that is unmatched by other 
materials. The soft, pliable fibers of this luxurious fabric 
create a texture that is both gentle and strong, yielding to the 
touch yet resilient to the elements. Each thread is a testament 
to the meticulous craftsmanship that goes into the creation of 
every piece, with its natural insulating properties providing 
unparalleled warmth and comfort. Whether draped in a 
classic coat or woven into a cozy blanket, wool evokes a sense 
of enduring style and enduring quality that will always 
remain in fashion.
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WEI’S TEXTILE

The manufacturing process of wool fabric involves several 
stages, each requiring skill and attention to detail. It begins 
with the shearing of wool from the fleece of sheep, which is 
then sorted and graded based on quality and fiber length. The 
raw wool is then washed and scoured to remove impurities 
and excess oil, and spun into yarn using specialized 
machinery. 

Once the yarn is spun, it undergoes a process called weaving, 
in which the threads are interlaced at right angles to create a 
tightly woven fabric. The fabric is then subjected to a process 
called fulling, in which it is washed and agitated to create a 
more dense, compact texture. This process also helps to 
remove any remaining impurities and improve the fabric's 
durability. 

After fulling, the fabric is typically dyed and finished, which 
involves a range of treatments to achieve the desired color, 
texture, and appearance. These treatments may include 
steaming, pressing, and brushing to smooth the surface and 
enhance the fabric's luster. 

Throughout the manufacturing process, skilled artisans work 
tirelessly to ensure that every piece of wool fabric meets the 
highest standards of quality and craftsmanship. From the 
careful selection of raw materials to the meticulous finishing 
touches, every step is a testament to the skill and dedication 
of those who create this timeless and elegant material. W08 

COMPOSITION 7%Wool+47%Acrylic+13%Mohair+33%Po
lyester

FINISHED 
WIDTH

67/68”

FUNCTION Thermal Regulation 

Anti-Odor

Anti-Bacterial

Wicking

Wool, a textile of timeless elegance, exudes a certain 
sophistication and refinement that is unmatched by other 
materials. The soft, pliable fibers of this luxurious fabric 
create a texture that is both gentle and strong, yielding to the 
touch yet resilient to the elements. Each thread is a testament 
to the meticulous craftsmanship that goes into the creation of 
every piece, with its natural insulating properties providing 
unparalleled warmth and comfort. Whether draped in a 
classic coat or woven into a cozy blanket, wool evokes a sense 
of enduring style and enduring quality that will always 
remain in fashion.
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WEI’S TEXTILE

The manufacturing process of wool fabric involves several 
stages, each requiring skill and attention to detail. It begins 
with the shearing of wool from the fleece of sheep, which is 
then sorted and graded based on quality and fiber length. The 
raw wool is then washed and scoured to remove impurities 
and excess oil, and spun into yarn using specialized 
machinery. 

Once the yarn is spun, it undergoes a process called weaving, 
in which the threads are interlaced at right angles to create a 
tightly woven fabric. The fabric is then subjected to a process 
called fulling, in which it is washed and agitated to create a 
more dense, compact texture. This process also helps to 
remove any remaining impurities and improve the fabric's 
durability. 

After fulling, the fabric is typically dyed and finished, which 
involves a range of treatments to achieve the desired color, 
texture, and appearance. These treatments may include 
steaming, pressing, and brushing to smooth the surface and 
enhance the fabric's luster. 

Throughout the manufacturing process, skilled artisans work 
tirelessly to ensure that every piece of wool fabric meets the 
highest standards of quality and craftsmanship. From the 
careful selection of raw materials to the meticulous finishing 
touches, every step is a testament to the skill and dedication 
of those who create this timeless and elegant material. 220088

COMPOSITION 100% Cashmere

FINISHED 
WIDTH

59/60”

FUNCTION Thermal Regulation 

Anti-Odor

Anti-Bacterial

Wicking

Wool, a textile of timeless elegance, exudes a certain 
sophistication and refinement that is unmatched by other 
materials. The soft, pliable fibers of this luxurious fabric 
create a texture that is both gentle and strong, yielding to the 
touch yet resilient to the elements. Each thread is a testament 
to the meticulous craftsmanship that goes into the creation of 
every piece, with its natural insulating properties providing 
unparalleled warmth and comfort. Whether draped in a 
classic coat or woven into a cozy blanket, wool evokes a sense 
of enduring style and enduring quality that will always 
remain in fashion.
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WEI’S TEXTILE

The manufacturing process of wool fabric involves several 
stages, each requiring skill and attention to detail. It begins 
with the shearing of wool from the fleece of sheep, which is 
then sorted and graded based on quality and fiber length. The 
raw wool is then washed and scoured to remove impurities 
and excess oil, and spun into yarn using specialized 
machinery. 

Once the yarn is spun, it undergoes a process called weaving, 
in which the threads are interlaced at right angles to create a 
tightly woven fabric. The fabric is then subjected to a process 
called fulling, in which it is washed and agitated to create a 
more dense, compact texture. This process also helps to 
remove any remaining impurities and improve the fabric's 
durability. 

After fulling, the fabric is typically dyed and finished, which 
involves a range of treatments to achieve the desired color, 
texture, and appearance. These treatments may include 
steaming, pressing, and brushing to smooth the surface and 
enhance the fabric's luster. 

Throughout the manufacturing process, skilled artisans work 
tirelessly to ensure that every piece of wool fabric meets the 
highest standards of quality and craftsmanship. From the 
careful selection of raw materials to the meticulous finishing 
touches, every step is a testament to the skill and dedication 
of those who create this timeless and elegant material. 3109

COMPOSITION 100% Cashmere

FINISHED 
WIDTH

57/58”

FUNCTION Thermal Regulation 

Anti-Odor

Anti-Bacterial

Wicking

Wool, a textile of timeless elegance, exudes a certain 
sophistication and refinement that is unmatched by other 
materials. The soft, pliable fibers of this luxurious fabric 
create a texture that is both gentle and strong, yielding to the 
touch yet resilient to the elements. Each thread is a testament 
to the meticulous craftsmanship that goes into the creation of 
every piece, with its natural insulating properties providing 
unparalleled warmth and comfort. Whether draped in a 
classic coat or woven into a cozy blanket, wool evokes a sense 
of enduring style and enduring quality that will always 
remain in fashion.
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WEI’S TEXTILE

The manufacturing process of wool fabric involves several 
stages, each requiring skill and attention to detail. It begins 
with the shearing of wool from the fleece of sheep, which is 
then sorted and graded based on quality and fiber length. The 
raw wool is then washed and scoured to remove impurities 
and excess oil, and spun into yarn using specialized 
machinery. 

Once the yarn is spun, it undergoes a process called weaving, 
in which the threads are interlaced at right angles to create a 
tightly woven fabric. The fabric is then subjected to a process 
called fulling, in which it is washed and agitated to create a 
more dense, compact texture. This process also helps to 
remove any remaining impurities and improve the fabric's 
durability. 

After fulling, the fabric is typically dyed and finished, which 
involves a range of treatments to achieve the desired color, 
texture, and appearance. These treatments may include 
steaming, pressing, and brushing to smooth the surface and 
enhance the fabric's luster. 

Throughout the manufacturing process, skilled artisans work 
tirelessly to ensure that every piece of wool fabric meets the 
highest standards of quality and craftsmanship. From the 
careful selection of raw materials to the meticulous finishing 
touches, every step is a testament to the skill and dedication 
of those who create this timeless and elegant material. MR002

COMPOSITION 30%Wool+35%Rayon+30%Acrylic+5%Sp
andex

FINISHED 
WIDTH

62/63”

FUNCTION Thermal Regulation 

Anti-Odor

Anti-Bacterial

Wicking

Wool, a textile of timeless elegance, exudes a certain 
sophistication and refinement that is unmatched by other 
materials. The soft, pliable fibers of this luxurious fabric 
create a texture that is both gentle and strong, yielding to the 
touch yet resilient to the elements. Each thread is a testament 
to the meticulous craftsmanship that goes into the creation of 
every piece, with its natural insulating properties providing 
unparalleled warmth and comfort. Whether draped in a 
classic coat or woven into a cozy blanket, wool evokes a sense 
of enduring style and enduring quality that will always 
remain in fashion.
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WEI’S TEXTILE

The manufacturing process of wool fabric involves several 
stages, each requiring skill and attention to detail. It begins 
with the shearing of wool from the fleece of sheep, which is 
then sorted and graded based on quality and fiber length. The 
raw wool is then washed and scoured to remove impurities 
and excess oil, and spun into yarn using specialized 
machinery. 

Once the yarn is spun, it undergoes a process called weaving, 
in which the threads are interlaced at right angles to create a 
tightly woven fabric. The fabric is then subjected to a process 
called fulling, in which it is washed and agitated to create a 
more dense, compact texture. This process also helps to 
remove any remaining impurities and improve the fabric's 
durability. 

After fulling, the fabric is typically dyed and finished, which 
involves a range of treatments to achieve the desired color, 
texture, and appearance. These treatments may include 
steaming, pressing, and brushing to smooth the surface and 
enhance the fabric's luster. 

Throughout the manufacturing process, skilled artisans work 
tirelessly to ensure that every piece of wool fabric meets the 
highest standards of quality and craftsmanship. From the 
careful selection of raw materials to the meticulous finishing 
touches, every step is a testament to the skill and dedication 
of those who create this timeless and elegant material. MR003

COMPOSITION 30%Alpaca Wool + 70%Wool

FINISHED 
WIDTH

59/60”

FUNCTION Thermal Regulation 

Anti-Odor

Anti-Bacterial

Wicking

Wool, a textile of timeless elegance, exudes a certain 
sophistication and refinement that is unmatched by other 
materials. The soft, pliable fibers of this luxurious fabric 
create a texture that is both gentle and strong, yielding to the 
touch yet resilient to the elements. Each thread is a testament 
to the meticulous craftsmanship that goes into the creation of 
every piece, with its natural insulating properties providing 
unparalleled warmth and comfort. Whether draped in a 
classic coat or woven into a cozy blanket, wool evokes a sense 
of enduring style and enduring quality that will always 
remain in fashion.
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WEI’S TEXTILE - WOOL FABRIC COLLECTION 


